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Chailey House, 
Bessels Way, 
Blewbury 

Outline application for demolition of existing bungalow.  
Erection of 30 dwellings comprising, 4x1 bed flats, 3x2 
bed flats, 8x3 bed homes and 3x4 bed houses (open 
market housing), 1x2 bed flat, 8x2 bed houses, 2x3 bed 
houses and 1x4 bed houses (affordable housing), 
extension to existing access, improvements to Bridus 
Way and provision of open space including 'Leap'. 
 
Recommendation: to grant planning permission, subject 
to s106 agreements and conditions. 
 

P13/V0458/O 

Church of Our 
Lady of The 
Rosary, 1 
Yarnells Hill, 
North Hinksey 

Retrospective application for demolition of floor slab 
and foundations. Cover demolition layer with recycled 
tarmac planings to allow access for maintenance and 
overflow carpark. Repair damaged drain. 
 
Recommendation: to grant planning permission, subject 
to conditions. 
 

P13/V1481/FUL 

Montgomery 
Traditional 
Butchers, 28 
Wallingford 
Street, Wantage 
 

Change of use from Butchers (A1 use) to Hot Food 
Takeaway (A5) including 2am late opening hours. 
 
Recommendation: to grant planning permission, subject 
to conditions. 

P13/V1435/FUL 

Land to rear of 1 
Wakes Place, 
Fernham Road, 
Longcot 

Demolish existing workshop and change of use to erect 
three bedroom detached dwelling.  (Re-submission of 
withdrawn application P13/V0307/FUL). 
 
Recommendation: Subject to the satisfactory outcome 
of the investigation of the presence of bats, to grant 
planning permission subject to conditions. 
 

P13/V1643/FUL 

102 Arthray 
Road, Botley 

Proposed two storey side extension and single storey 
rear extension. 
 
Recommendation: to grant planning permission, subject 
to conditions. 
 

P13/V1562/HH 

32 Arthray 
Road, Botley 

Two storey side and rear extension to dwelling house 
(resubmission). 
 
Recommendation: to grant planning permission, subject 
to conditions. 

P13/V0919/HH 

 


